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Château Olivier Rouge 2015 

WINE SPECTATOR 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Pessac-Léognan 2015    Score : 89-92  
 
Enticing, offering bitter plum and dark cherry notes, with a supple structure, a whiff of 
black tea and a polished finish.– J.M. 

 

James SUCKLING 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Pessac-Léognan 2015    Score : 92-93 

A solid and chewy red with walnut shell, ripe berry and chocolate aromas and flavors. 
Lots of tannins. Full body. Coming together nicely.  

 

DECANTER 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Pessac-Léognan 2015    Score 93 

Power and poise of rich, muscular tannic frame for good ageing potential. Continuing the 
more serious expression of Olivier over last few years, begun with the inclusion of the 
new… 

Taster: Jane Anson 

 

JANCIS ROBINSON 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Pessac-Léognan 2015    Score 16,5 

Dark crimson. Thick and sweet. Lots of intensity. Just rather harsh tannic charge on the 
end. Very ambitious but not very relaxed! 
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WINE ADVOCATE 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Red Pessac-Léognan 2015  Score   91-92 
  

The 2015 Chateau Olivier offers vivacious red cherry and crisp strawberry fruit on the 
nose, biding its time, gently unfolding in the glass until it takes full flight. The palate is 
medium-bodied with fine tannin and smooth wild strawberry and raspberry fruit, laced 
with cedar and a pleasant saltiness. This is one of the best Château Olivier reds in recent 
years. This is one of the best wines from Chateau Olivier in recent years, thanks to its 
greater depth and harmony. Laurent Lebrun has done a great job here. 

 

WINE ENTHUSIAST ROGER VOSS 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Red Pessac-Léognan 2015  Score   91-93 
  
Power and poise of rich, muscular tannic frame for good ageing potential. Continuing the 
more serious expression of Olivier over last few years, begun with the inclusion of the 
new… 

 

La Revue du Vin de France 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Rouge 2015  16,5-17,5/20 
 
L'un des meilleurs rouges d'Olivier depuis vingt ans II réunit la richesse de l'année, un 
équilibre fin apporte par la fraicheur du fruit et la pro fondeur des cabernets sur graves 
Complet, long, savoureux et très justement extrait, 2015 replace ce cru classe a son rang 

 



 

 

[Tapez ici] 

 

Château Olivier Blanc 2015 

WINE SPECTATOR  

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Pessac-Léognan White 2015 Score 91-94 
 
This has some weight, with lemon curd, dried verbena and chamomile notes around a 
core of yellow apple and salted butter. Stays lively shoming good cut on the finish. J.M. 

 

WINE ENTHUSIAST ROGER VOSS 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER White Pessac-Léognan 2015 Score 92–94.  

Green and herbal in character, this crisp wine just touches on a riper yellow fruit 
character. It will develop with fine straight fruit definition. 

 

DECANTER 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Pessac-Léognan White 2015 Score 94 

This estate reworked its whites with the 2007 vintage, when it shifted from 50/50 
Sauvignon Blanc-Semillon to 75% Sauvignon Blanc  

Taster: Jane Anson  

 

James SUCKLING 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER White Pessac-Léognan 2015   Score : 92-93 

 

A fresh and clean white with sliced pineapple and pear aromas and flavors. Full body, 
hints of mineral. Crisp finish. 
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WINE ADVOCATE 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Pessac-Léognan White 2015 Score 90-92 

The 2015 Château Olivier Blanc has a lively citrus and lime flower scented bouquet, with 
pear and almost granitic notes surfacing with aeration. The palate is very well balanced 
with crisp acidity - green apple, gooseberry and a twist of sour lemon towards the finish. 
There is something almost Loire-like here, perhaps a little Sancerre-like in style, but 
irrespective of stylistic semblances, the bottom line is that this constitutes a very fine 
white Bordeaux that will be delicious from the word go. 

 

JANCIS ROBINSON 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Pessac-Léognan White 2015 Score 16,5  

 

Light and sweet on the nose. Very racy and super-appetising and juicy. Not one of the 
most concentrated but fresh and classic. Minerally finish. 

Le Point 

CHÂTEAU OLIVIER Blanc 2015  15/20 
 

 

 

 

 


